
About Client

LEXCODE, a translation company with over 20 years of experience, provides high-quality
translation services to clients worldwide. Their team of over 1,000 employees leverages
cutting-edge technology to deliver exceptional results, solidifying their position as a pioneer
in AI-powered translation.

About Project

LEXCODE approached our company with a critical and time-sensitive translation project.
They required a rapid turnaround on substantial volumes of documents. The project scope
included translating from English into Brazilian Portuguese, Indonesian, Vietnamese, and
Russian. Given the sensitive nature of the legal content, accuracy and consistency were
paramount, while the tight deadline imposed significant logistical challenges.

Solution We Provided

1. Assembled a highly skilled team of linguists with expertise in relevant industry and
content type. Their in-depth knowledge ensured accurate and nuanced translations.

2. Employed advanced translation technology to enhance efficiency and consistency.
3. Implemented a comprehensive project management system to oversee the entire

translation process. It involved meticulous planning, resource allocation, and real-time
tracking to meet strict deadlines.

4. Established a multi-tiered quality assurance process to guarantee exceptional output.
This included translation reviews, editing, proofreading, and final quality checks.

5. Strategically allocated resources, including translators, editors, and project managers, to
efficiently handle the large volume of content while maintaining high quality.

6. Enabled open and transparent communication with the LEXCODE team throughout the
project. Regular updates and progress reports ensured alignment and addressed any
concerns promptly.



7. Successfully delivered all translations within the specified timeframe, demonstrating
our commitment to meeting client deadlines without compromising quality

About CCJK

Founded in 2002, CCJK, a company of highly skilled professionals from around the Asia-
Pacific region, has formed an elite engineering group that is dedicated, knowledgeable, and
has a deeply rooted sense of responsibility. CCJK always insists that winning client’s trust
and confidence is of paramount importance to the very existence of an organization. CCJK
dedicates itself to tailoring its services to meet the unique needs of each client. For every
project, no matter whether it is big or small, sophisticated or trivial, the whole team is
committed to working synchronically to make the project mutually successful, both for the
client and CCJK.


